


  

3URMHFW�3URÞOH

&OLHQW�

Planet Organic

/RFDWLRQ�

Queens Park, London

3URMHFW�

Our latest store format for 
leading organic supermarket in 
North West London featuring 
key product focus areas; food 
to go, with hot food, salads and 
healthy fresh juice refreshments 
available to eat within the cafe 
area or to take away. The store 
has a large range of organic 
SURGXFH�LQFOXGLQJ�WKH�LQÁXHQ-
tial unpackaged range of store 
cupboard essentials, organic 
fruit and vegetables, a natural 
health and beauty section and 
plenty of eco living products for 
the home.
 
3URMHFW�6FRSH�

Design Time have worked with 
the Planet Organic retail team 
for over 5 years, providing 
design, architectural and project 
management services . 

During this time the emphasis 
has been upon the development 
of an immersive store environ-
ment that increses dwell time, 
and encourages healthy living.

3URJUDPPH� 
9 Months Design and 
Planning.

3URMHFW�6L]H�

800 sqM typically   

�ZZZ�GHVLJQWLPH�XN�FRP

&RQWDFW�����

7HO����������������������
DGW#GHVLJQWLPH�XN�FRP

'HVLJQ�7LPH�/LPLWHG��
�D�&DOOV�/DQGLQJ��7KH�&DOOV��
/HHGV��(QJODQG
/6���(:

  $UFKLWHFWXUDO�6HUYLFHV

  3URMHFW�0DQDJHPHQW

  6XUYH\

  &RQWUDFWRU�0DQDJHPHQW



 

Project Profile

Client:

Diptyque 
Location:

Floral Street, Covent Garden.
Project:

&RPSOHWH�UHÀW�RI�WKH�/RQGRQ�UH-
WDLO�ÁDJVKLS�VWRUH�IRU�WKLV�OX[XU\�
FDQGOH�DQG�IUDJUDQFH�FRPSDQ\�

7KH�EUDQG�LV�DOVR�UHSUHVHQWHG�
LQ�NH\�GHSDUWPHQW�VWRUH�ORFD-
WLRQV��DQG�LQ������'HVLJQ�7LPH�
KDYH�FUHDWHG�FRQFHVVLRQ�VWRUHV�
ZLWKLQ�WKH�QHZ�+DUURGV�%HDXW\�
+DOO�DQG�/LEHUW\�DQG�&R�
 
Project Scope:

:RUNLQJ�ZLWK�WKH�3DULV
EDVHG�FRQFHSW�WHDP��'HVLJQ�
7LPH�ZDV�UHVSRQVLEOH�IRU�WKH�
GHVLJQ�PDQDJHPHQW��
DUFKLWHFWXUDO�DQG�30�VHUYLFHV�
EULQJLQJ�WRJHWKHU�WKH�WHDP�WR�
GHOLYHU�WKH�SURMHFW��

Programme: 
���0RQWKV�'HVLJQ�DQG�
3ODQQLQJ�
Project Size:

����VT0�� 

 www.designtime.uk.com

Contact:    

Tel: +44 (0) 113 244 2602
adt@designtime.uk.com

Design Time Limited. 
3a Calls Landing, The Calls, 
Leeds, England
LS2 7EW

  Implementation Design
  Project Management

  Survey

  Flagship Store Development



 

Project Profile

Client:

ace & tate
Location:

Locations across UK & Ireland.

Project:

The implementation of the 
successful brand concept and 
identity to a diverse range of 
properties in various locations 
PU�3VUKVU�HUK�[OL�ÄYZ[�Z[VYL�PU�
Ireland. The roll-out continues 
for this Dutch on-trend eyewear 
retailer.

We have completed stores in 
Soho, Covent Garden, 
Bristol, Manchester and Dublin 
during 2018.

Project Scope:

Working with the Ace & Tate 
concept team, Design Time 
provided design, architectural 
and project management 
service . Works included struc-
[\YHS�TVKPÄJH[PVUZ��Z[HPYJHZL�
installations, and extensive 
mechanical and electrical 
services.

Programme: 
6 Months Design and 
Planning.

Project Size:

300 sqM typically   

 www.designtime.uk.com

Contact:    

Tel: +44 (0) 113 244 2602
adt@designtime.uk.com

Design Time Limited. 
3a Calls Landing, The Calls, 
Leeds, England
LS2 7EW

  Architectural Services
  Project Management

  Survey

  Contractor Management



 

Project Profile

Client:

Farmer J

Location:

King William Street, City of 
London.

Project:

Construction of the second 
restaurant at the heart of the 
*P[ �̀�L]VS]PUN�MYVT�[OL�ÄYZ[�
restaurant at Leadenhall.

Project Scope:

Working with the concept team, 
Design Time was responsible 
for the design management, 
architectural and project 
management services for the 
project. 

We also brought together the 
team to deliver the project. 

Works included structural 
TVKPÄJH[PVUZ��MVYTH[PVU�VM�
high-quality kitchen and bar 
facilities, a great versatile 
front-of-house  area and 
extensive mechanical and 
electrical services.

Programme: 
8 Months Design and 
Planning.

Project Size:

250 sqM   

 www.designtime.uk.com

Contact:    

Tel: +44 (0) 113 244 2602
adt@designtime.uk.com

Design Time Limited. 
3a Calls Landing, The Calls, 
Leeds, England
LS2 7EW

  Implementation Design
  Project Management

  Survey

  Contractor Management



��

Project Profile

Client:

O’Neill

Location:

Wijnegem, Belgium

Project: 
Concept development, detailled 
design and construction man-
agement of a new concept store 
for O’Neill in Wijnegem. Design 
Time have completed stores 
across the globe for O’Neill. 

Locations include Hamburg, 
Dresden, Dortmund + Oberhau-
sen in Germany; Rotterdam in 
Netherlands; Koksijde, Brugge, 
and Gent in Belgium; Hong 
Kong, Sydney, Peru and Oki-
nawa in Japan 

Design Time have undertaken 
Outlet stores in Pandorf Aus-
tria; Annopol Poland; Berlin + 
Wolfsburg in Germany; Rosada  
+ Leystad in Netherlands; and 
Luxemburg. Additionally we 
have also developed a SIS sys-
tem solution for Spain France, 
Belgium, Switzerland and 
China.

Project Scope:

Our role involved the design 
KL]LSVWTLU[�VM�ZWLJPHSPZ[�Ä_-
[\YLZ�HUK�Ä[[PUNZ�HUK�[OL�KLZPNU�
management of this store 
according to brand guidelines. 

Working regularly with O’Neill 
we were also responsible for 
all client liaisons and the day to 
day management of the  con-
struction program. 
 

 www.designtime.uk.com

Contact:    

Tel: +44 (0) 113 244 2602

mail@adesigntime.com

Design Time Limited. 

3A Calls Landing, The Calls, 

Leeds, England

LS2 7EW

� Fixture development

� Lighting design

� Design and detail drawings

� Client Liaison 

� Project Managment

� Concept Design



  

3URMHFW�3URÞOH

&OLHQW�

Joe & The Juice

/RFDWLRQ�

Locations across London.

3URMHFW�

The implementation of the 
successful brand concept and 
identity to a diverse range of  
metropolitan properties.

We have completed outlets at 
North Audley St, Mayfair and 
Kings Road amongst a number  
during 2019 to a new design 
concept for the Danish 
coffee and juice super-brand 
with over 250 outlets worldwide.

3URMHFW�6FRSH�

Working with the Joe & The 
Juice concept team, Design 
Time provided design, 
architectural and project 
management services . 

Works included structural 
PRGLÀFDWLRQV��VWDLUFDVH�
 installations, and extensive 
mechanical and electrical 
services including specialist 
systems.

3URJUDPPH� 
6 Months Design and 
Planning.

3URMHFW�6L]H�

300 sqM typically   

�ZZZ�GHVLJQWLPH�XN�FRP

&RQWDFW�����

7HO����������������������
DGW#GHVLJQWLPH�XN�FRP

'HVLJQ�7LPH�/LPLWHG��
�D�&DOOV�/DQGLQJ��7KH�&DOOV��
/HHGV��(QJODQG
/6���(:

  $UFKLWHFWXUDO�6HUYLFHV

  3URMHFW�0DQDJHPHQW

  6XUYH\

  &RQWUDFWRU�0DQDJHPHQW



  

Project Profile

Client:

Joe & The Juice

Location:

Locations across London.

Project:

The implementation of the 
successful brand concept and 
identity to a diverse range of  
metropolitan properties.

We have completed outlets at 
Chiswick, Wimbledon, Tower 
42 and on Rathbone Place and 
Fulham Road, amongst others,  
during 2018 for the Danish 
JVɈLL�HUK�Q\PJL�Z\WLY�IYHUK�
with over 250 outlets world�
wide.

Project Scope:

Working with the Joe & The 
Juice concept team, Design 
Time provided design, 
HYJOP[LJ[\YHS�HUK�WYVQLJ[�
management service . 

Works included structural 
TVKPÄJH[PVUZ��Z[HPYJHZL�
 installations, and extensive 
mechanical and electrical 
services including specialist 
systems.

Programme: 
6 Months Design and 
Planning.

Project Size:

300 sqM typically   

 www.designtime.uk.com

Contact:    

Tel: +44 (0) 113 244 2602
adt@designtime.uk.com

Design Time Limited. 
3a Calls Landing, The Calls, 
Leeds, England
LS2 7EW

  Architectural Services
  Project Management

  Survey

  Contractor Management



�

Project Profile

Client:

Planet Organic
Location: 

Southside, Wandsworth.

Project:

Planet Organic are a special-
ity retailer catering for ethically 
aware consumers, emersing 
and engaging them in the qual-
ity of the merchandise through 
sampling and other experiencial 
and tactile ways.

Project Scope: 

*\Z[VT�KLZPNULK�Ä_[\YLZ�HUK�
Ä[[PUNZ�ZL[�PU�H�JVU[LTWVYHY`�
retail environment conveying 
brand values of food quality, 
supply chain credibility and 
freshness. At the point of sale, 
check-outs are designed to be 
simple to use and customer 
friendly in operation.
Speciality areas for the sale of 
high value produce, such as 
skin treatment, nutrition and 
beauty products feature within 
the store.

The Food to Go area creates a 
tranquil area to relax and take a 
break, and encourage regular 
usage of the store by local com-
munity.

Design Time provided a com-
plete service from concept, 
through detailed design to 
execution.

Programme: 
6 Months Design and Planning, 
PUJS\KPUN����^LLR�Ä[�V\[�WLYPVK�

 www.designtime.uk.com

Contact:    

Tel: +44 (0) 113 244 2602

mail@adesigntime.com

Design Time Limited. 

3A Calls Landing, The Calls, 

Leeds, England

LS2 7EW

� Fixtures Development

� Architectural Services

� Project Management

� Cost Management 



 

Project Profile

Client:

Byredo 
Location:

Lexington Street, Soho.
Project:

Construction of the exquisite 
high-end retail space and head 
VɉJL�^P[O�HUJPSSHY`�HYLHZ�VU�[OL�
corner of Lexington Street and 
Beak Street.
 
Project Scope:

>VYRPUN�^P[O�[OL�:[VJROVST
IHZLK�JVUJLW[�[LHT��+LZPNU�
;PTL�^HZ�YLZWVUZPISL�MVY�[OL�
KLZPNU�THUHNLTLU[��
architectural and PM services 
IYPUNPUN�[VNL[OLY�[OL�[LHT�[V�
deliver the project. 

>VYRZ�V]LY�ZP_�ÅVVY�SL]LSZ�
included extensive structural 
TVKPÄJH[PVUZ�[V�YLTVKLS�[OL�
YL[HPS�HYLHZ��H�KYHTH[PJ�MLH[\YL�
Z[HPYJHZL�HUK�PUÄUP[`�SPM[��H�
versatile gallery space and 
^VYRZ�[V�[OL�L_[LYPVY��

*VTWSL_�Z`Z[LTZ�MVY�LSLJ[YPJZ��
SPNO[PUN��ZLJ\YP[ �̀�TLJOHUPJHS�
WSHU[�HUK�H\KPV�]PZ\HS�^LYL�
installed throughout.

6[OLY�YLJLU[�>LZ[�,UK�ÅHNZOPW�
Z[VYLZ�JVTWSL[LK�I`�+LZPNU�
;PTL�PUJS\KL�3\ZO�VU�6_MVYK�
St, LEGO on Leicester Squre, 
Space NK on Regent St, 
and  ASICS on Oxford St. 
Programme: 
����4VU[OZ�+LZPNU�HUK�
Planning.
Project Size:

����ZX4�V]LY���ÅVVYZ�� 

 www.designtime.uk.com

Contact:    

Tel: +44 (0) 113 244 2602
adt@designtime.uk.com

Design Time Limited. 
3a Calls Landing, The Calls, 
Leeds, England
LS2 7EW

  Implementation Design
  Project Management

  Survey

  Flagship Store Development



 

Project Profile

Client:

Lush

Location:

Castle Lane, Belfast.

Project:

Construction of the Belfast 
Flagship store on a prominent 
corner location at the heart of 
the city’s shopping district.

The store features a custom 
made 35m long traditional 
hardwood shopfront on two 
elevations restoring the former 
splendour to the property.

We have also completed stores 
in Derby, Warrington, Hull and 
Solihull during 2018. 

Project Scope:

Working with the Lush concept 
team, Design Time was respon-
sible for shopfront design and 
for the architectural and project 
management services for the 
whole project. 

Project included structural 
TVKPÄJH[PVUZ��SPM[�PUZ[HSSH[PVU��
and extensive mechanical and 
electrical services

Programme: 
10 Months Design and 
Planning.

Project Size:

����ZX4�V]LY���ÅVVYZ�� 

 www.designtime.uk.com

Contact:    

Tel: +44 (0) 113 244 2602
adt@designtime.uk.com

Design Time Limited. 
3a Calls Landing, The Calls, 
Leeds, England
LS2 7EW

  Architectural Services
  Project Management

  Survey

  Contractor Management
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Project Profile

Client:

Natoora
Location: 

Pavilion Road, Chelsea.

Project:

Natoora are a speciality retailer ca-
tering for ethically aware consumers, 
emersing and engaging them in the 
quality of the merchandise through 
sampling and other experiencial and 
tactile ways.

Project Scope: 

*\Z[VT�KLZPNULK�Ä_[\YLZ�HUK�
Ä[[PUNZ�ZL[�PU�H�JVU[LTWVYHY`�YL[HPS�
environment conveying brand 
values of food quality, supply chain 
credibility and freshness.  

Speciality areas for demonstrating 
product and engaging with custom-
ers.

Design Time provided a complete 
service from concept, through 
detailed design to execution.

Programme: 
6 Months Design and Planning, 
PUJS\KPUN����^LLR�Ä[�V\[�WLYPVK�

Project Size:

200sq M

 www.designtime.uk.com

Contact:    

Tel: +44 (0) 113 244 2602
mail@adesigntime.com

Design Time Limited. 
3A Calls Landing, The Calls, 
Leeds, England
LS2 7EW

� Fixtures Development
� Architectural Services

� Project Management

� Cost Management 



Project Profile

Client:

Sarah Chapman

Location:

VɈ�:SVHUL�:X\HYL

Project:

+LZPNU;PTL�^LYL�HWWYVHJOLK�
I`�:HYHO�*OHWTHU�[V�JYLH[L�
KLZPNU�JVUJLW[Z�HUK�IYHUKPUN�
MVY�H�ÅHNZOPW�Z[VYL�PU�:SVHUL�
:[YLL[�

6\Y�L_WLY[PZL�^P[O�V[OLY�RL`�
IYHUKZ�PU�[OPZ�THYRL[�ZLJ[VY�
^HZ�RL`�[V�ZLJ\YPUN�H�SHUKTHYR�
WYLTPZLZ�^P[O�*HKVNHU�
,Z[H[LZ�

Project Scope:

+LZPNU;PTL�WYV]PKL�H�JVTWYL-
OLUZP]L�HYJOP[LJ[\YHS�ZLY]PJLZ�
WHJRHNL�MYVT�Z\Y]L`�[OYV\NO�
Z[VYL�WSHUUPUN�ZLY]PJLZ�

-\SS��+�YLUKLYZ�^P[O�YL[HPS�^HSR�
[OYV\NO�^HZ�H�RL`�YLX\PYLTLU[�
MVY�[OPZ�YLSH]P]LS`�\UWYV]LU�
YL[HPS�VWLYH[VY�

Programme:

��4VU[OZ�+LZPNU�HUK�:[VYL�
7SHUUPUN�

Project Size:

����ZX4��

 www.designtime.uk.com

Contact:    

Tel: +44 (0) 113 244 2602

adt@designtime.uk.com

Design Time Limited. 

3a Calls Landing, The Calls, 

Leeds, England

LS2 7EW

Store Design

Detail Drawings

Survey

Architectural Services


